
BID TABULATION
ITB# 28-22 SAFETY GLOVES (CC: 34572)
JOY MCDOWELL, PRINCIPAL BUYER
MCDOWELLJ@JCCAL.ORG

Group 1 Non-CDC Approved

1. MINI WING
2. EIGHT 
FIVE 
ORANGE LLC

3. Vizocom ICT 
LLC

4. Uweport
5. 3G Chemical 
Solutions LLC

6. PACIFIC 
BRIDGE   
SOURCING 
MANAGEMENT 
dba BENCHMARK 
HEALTH

 7. ALPHA 
PRO MED 
LLC

8. Alabama 
Industrial 
Supplies &  
Services

9. BUYERS 
POINT LLC

10. Alabama 
Construction 
Supply

TIERED PRICING
0-9,999 0.25-.023 0.30 0.35 0.35 0.40 0.40 0.55 0.62 0.86

Extended Price $2,299.77 0-$2999.70 0-$3,499.65
$3,499.65 
per 9,999 .40-$3,999.60 0-$3,999.60 $5,500.00

$0.00-
$6,199.38 $8,599.14

10,000-29,999 0.23-0.22 0.25 0.29 0.33 0.37 0.40 0.53 $0.58 0.86

Extended Price 
$2,300.00-
$6,599.78

$2,500.00-
$7,499.75

$3,499.65-
$8,700.00

$3,300.00 
per 10k

$3,700-
$11,099.63

$4,000-
$11,999.00 $15,900.00

$5,800.00-
$17,399.42 $25,799.14

30,000-49,999 0.22-0.20 0.20 0.28 0.30 0.35 0.40 0.50 $0.54 0.86

Extended Price 
$6,600.00-
$9,999.80

$6,000.00-
$9,999.80

$8,700.00-
$14,500.00

$9,000 per 
30k

$10,500-
$17,499.65

12,000.00-
19,999.60 $25,000.00

$16,200.00-
$26,999.46 $42,999.14

MFG

GUOYAN

Suzhou 
Konlinda 
Precision 
Electronic 
Co. ltd

Changzhou 
Combat

Yiwu Qixum 
Scientific Co. 
Ltd. 

Jinhua Enjoy & 
Wonderful, Inc.

Dong Guan 
Yunzim 
technology 
limited co.

Alphaprome
d

Seattle Glove, 
Inc. Powecom

Year Production 2021 2021 2021 2021 2020 2020 2022 2021 2022
Quantity: 1 each

Shipping Package UoM Individually 
wrapped

400 
pc/carton Case 5/box Case

   
box, 64 
boxes per 
case 10 each/pack 1 EACH

Unit Price (Individual mask) 0.25 0.30 0.35 0.35 0.40 0.40 0.55 0.62 0.86
TOTAL

1. Mini Wing
2. Vizocom 
ICT LLC  3. Uweport LLC

4. Eight Five 
Orange

5. 3G Chemical 
Solutions, LLC

6. Alphapro Med 
LLC 7. Fastenal

8. BUYERS 
POINT LLC

9. Alabama 
Industrial 
Supply Inc. 
LLC

10. Pacific 
Bridge 

TIERED PRICING
0-9,999 0.25-0.23 0.35 0.35 0.45 0.45 0.55 0.79 0.86 $1.09

Extended Price $2,299.77 0-$3,499.65
$3,499.65 per 
9,999 0-$4499.55 .45-4,499.55 $5,500.00 $7,899.21 $8,599.14

0.00-
$10,898.91

10,000-29,999 0.23-0.22 0.29 0.33 $0.38 0.42 0.53 0.658 0.86 1.05

NO BID

 

Item No 1                                                        
KN95 Masks - removable strip, must filter 
95% or airborne particles, straps must affix to 
masks using an adhesive, must not contain any 
visible metal-including staples, color: white, 
adjustable nose strip bracket, individually 
wrapped, glue-free, odorless, high efficiency, 
electrostatic filter, and non-woven fabric.

   
       

        
        

     
      

  

mailto:MCDOWELLJ@JCCAL.ORG


Extended Price 
$2,300.00-
6,599.78

$3,499.65-
$8,700.00

$3,300.00 per 
10k

$3,800-
$11,399.62 4200-12,599.58 $15,900.00 $19,739.34 $25,799.14

$10,500-
$31,498.95

30,000-49,999 0.22-0.20 0.28 0.30 $0.32 0.40 0.50 0.658 0.86 1.01

Extended Price 
$6,600.00-
$9,999.80

$8,700.00-
$14,500.00

$9,000.00 per 
30k

$9,600-
$15,999.68

$12,000-
$19,999.60 $25,000.00 $32,899.34 $42,999.14

$30,300-
$50,498.99

MFG

GUOYAN
Changzhou 
Combat

Yiwu Qixun 
Scientific Co. Ltd

Changzhou 
Combat 
Protective 
Equipment 

Fukian Lome 
Nursing 
Materials Alphapromed Safeton Powecom

KNA 
Apparel 
Sourcing 

Year Production 2021 2021 2020 2022 2022 2021
Quantity: 1 each 1 each 

Shipping Package UoM
Individually 
Wrapped

Case-
Disposable 
mask 1000 pcs Case

30 pieces per 
box, 64 boxes per 
case Case 1000 1 EACH

2 each per 
sealed 
pack/10 
each per 
box

Unit Price (Individual mask) 0.25

TOTAL

Vizocom

Miniwing

Pacific Bridge 
Sourcing 
Management 
dba Benchmark 
Health

UWEPORT 
LLC Fastenal Eight Five Orange

3G Chemical 
Solutions, 
LLC Alphapro med

Alabama 
Constructio
n Supply

TIERED PRICING NO BID

0-9,999 0.05 0.05 0.08 0.11 0.13 $0.18 0.15 0.20 $0.09

Extended Price $499.95 $499.95 0-$799.92
$1,099.89 
per 9999 $1,299.87 $0-$1,799.82 $.15-1,499.85 $2,000.00 $899.91

10,000-29,999 0.04 0.05-0.045 0.06 0.07 0.13 $0.15 0.12 0.18 $0.08

Extended Price 
$499.95-
$1,200.00

$500.00-
$1,349.96

$600.00-
$1,799.94

$700.00 per 
10k $3,899.87 $1500-$4499.85

 $1,200.00-
$3,599.88 $5,400.00 $2,249.93

30,000-49,999 0.04 0.045-0.04 0.04 0.6 0.13 $0.12 0.10 0.17 $0.06

Extended Price 
$1,200.00-
$2,000.00

$1,350.00 -
$1,999.96

$1,200.00-
$1,999.96

$1,800.00 
per 30k $5,899.88

$3,660.00-
$5,999.88

$3,000.00-
$4,999.99 $8,500.00 $3,209.94

MFG Vizocare

Savvy Tails Baozhi
Intco Int'l 
(HK) Co. Ltd. Safeton

Jiangyin RuoQiao 
Medical Supplies 

Co., LTD

Tuosheng 
Protective 
Products Alphapromed PIP

Year Production 2021 Shelf life 2021 2020 2022

Quantity: 1 each

NO BID

ITEM No. 2 
KN 95 Masks-Removable strip, must filter 95% 
of airborne particles, straps must affix to masks 
using an adhesive, must not contain any visible 
metal-including staples, color: black, adjustable 
nose strip bracket, individually wrapped, glue 
free and odorless.

ITEM No. 3                                              
Surgical Masks or approved equal.Woven 
Masks-Elastic ear loops/straps, disposable, latex 
free; color: blue, three-ply design an adjustable 
nose piece.



Shipping Package UoM Case

50 PCS/BOX
50 pcs/box/40 
boxes/case Box 0f 50 Case 2000 3000 pcs Case

50 pcs per 
box, 40 boxes 
per case 50/box

Unit Price (Individual mask) 0.05
TOTAL

                                                
     

     
       
 





BID TABULATION
48-22 GLOVES: GENERAL PURPOSE & MEDICAL 
JOY MCDOWELL, PRINCIPAL BUYER

1. HEMERA 
HOLDING LLC

2. MERSI 
DISTRIBUTIO

N

3. 
ADVETAGE 
SOLUTIONS 

LLC

4. UWEPORT, 
LLC

5. 
LABSOURCE

6. AMD 
MEDICOM 

INC.

7. ALWAYS 
AVAILABLE 

WHOLESALES 
& SUPPLY 

CORP.

8. MINI WING 
USA

9. SHERWIN 
WILLIAMS

UOM

1
X-SMALL, MEDLINE ITEM#MDS6800 

OR APPROVED EQUAL CASE $88.00 $100.00 $90.00 $115.00 $135.00 $164.00 $201.95 $230.50 $422.50

2 SMALL, MEDLINE ITEM#MDS6801 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL CASE $74.00 $74.50 $90.00 $115.00 $140.00 $184.00 $201.95 $230.50 $422.50

3
MEDIUM, MEDLINE ITEM#MDS6802 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL CASE $73.00 $74.50 $90.00 $115.00 $148.00 $184.00 $201.95 $230.50 546.71

4
LARGE, MEDLINE ITEM#MDS6803 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL CASE $74.00 $74.50 $90.00 $115.00 $145.00 $184.00 $201.95 $230.50 $546.71

5 X-LARGE, MEDLINE ITEM#MDS6804 
OR APPROVED EQUAL CASE $72.50 $74.50 $90.00 $115.00 $145.00 $184.00 $201.95 $230.50 $422.50

TOTAL: $114,450.00 $119,400.00 $135,00.00 $172,500.00 $213,900.00 $270,000.00 $302,925.00 $345,750.00 $708,276.00

UOM

1
SMALL, ITEM# 181100 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES CASE

2
MEDIUM, ITEM# 181200 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES CASE

3
LARGE, ITEM# 181300 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES CASE

4
X-LARGE, ITEM # 181350 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE 
OF 500 GLOVES

CASE

5
XX-LARGE, ITEM # 181400 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE 
OF 500 GLOVES

CASE

TOTAL: $156,690.00 $172,500.00 $231,459.00

PRICE

GROUP A: SENSICARE ICE BLUE NITRILE EXAM 
GLOVES WITH FILM, 2500, 250/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE PRICE

1. LABSOURCE INC. 2. MINI WING USA

$104.46

$104.46 $115.00

$115.00 $154.90

$151.68

$104.46 $115.00

3.  ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 
CORP.

GROUP B: DERMASSIST EP BLUE EXTENDED CUFF 
EXAM GLOVES, POWDER- FREE, LATEX HIGH RISK, 

THICK 15 MIL, NON-STERILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 
BLUE, SINGLE-USE, 25 PAIR/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE

$154.95

$104.46 $115.00 $155.00

$104.46 $115.00 $155.00



BID TABULATION
48-22 GLOVES: GENERAL PURPOSE & MEDICAL 
JOY MCDOWELL, PRINCIPAL BUYER

UOM

1
SMALL, ITEM# 181100 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES

CASE

2
MEDIUM, ITEM# 181200 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES

CASE

3
LARGE, ITEM# 181300 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 500 
GLOVES

CASE

4
X-LARGE, ITEM # 181350 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE 
OF 500 GLOVES

CASE

5
XX-LARGE, ITEM # 181400 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE 
OF 500 GLOVES CASE

TOTAL

5. MINI WING USA

UOM

1
X-SMALL, ITEM# 155050 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL-PRICE ER CASE OF 
1.000 GLOVES CASE $116.42

2
SMALL,  ITEM#155100 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 1,000 
GLOVES CASE $116.42

3
MEDIUM, ITEM# 155200 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 1,000 
GLOVES CASE 116.42

4
LARGE,  ITEM# 155300 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 1,000 
GLOVES CASE $116.42

5
X-LARGE, ITEM# 155350 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL-PRICE PER CASE OF 1,000 
GLOVES CASE $116.42

$174,630.00

$57.00

$85.00

$86.30

PRICE

GROUP C:DERMAGOLD EP GLOVES EXTENDED 
CUFF, POWDER-FREE, EXTRA PROTECTION, THICK 

10 MIL, LATEX EXAMINATION GLOVES; NON-
STERILE; SINGLE USE, 25 PAIR/BOX; 10 BOXES/CASE

PRICE

1. LABSOURCE INC MINI WING USA

GROUP D: DERMAGOLD EP GLOVES EXTENDED 
CUFF, POWDER-FREE, EXTRA PROTECTION, THICK 

10 MIL, LATEX EXAMINATION GLOVES; NON-
STERILE; SINGLE USE, 25 PAIR/BOX; 10 BOXES/CASE

2. NORFLEET 
DISTRIBUTORS LLC 3. LABSOURCE INC

4. ALWAYS AVAILABLE 
WHOLESALES& SUPPLY 

CORP.
1. HEMERA

$172,170.00 

$116.00
$118.80

$116.00
$119.00

$57,000.00 $72,000.00 $91,632.00 $129,294.00TOTAL

$112.10

$116.00

$113.00

$119.00

$63.25 $86.30

$105.00
$113.00

$38.00 $48.00

$38.00 $48.00

$55.00

$172,200.00 

$86.30

$38.00 $48.00 $58.24 $86.30

$38.00

$38.00 $48.00

$48.00

$63.25



BID TABULATION
48-22 GLOVES: GENERAL PURPOSE & MEDICAL 
JOY MCDOWELL, PRINCIPAL BUYER

Notification of Intent to Respond x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x
x x x x x x x x x

2. MERSI DISTRIBUTION LLC/1000 Bricknell Ave, STE 715/PBM 1423/Miami, FL 33131/800-654-0186/Faris Mersi/faris@mersidistribution.com
3. ADVETAGE SOLUTIONS/111 Penn Street, Suite 202/ El Segundo, CA 90245/424-292-8415/Matt Cortina/matt.cortina@advetage.com
4. UWEPORT, LLC/3623 Latrobe Drive, Suite 201/Charlotte, NC 28211/386-473-3785/Maklin Ryan/maklin@uweport.com
5. LABSOURCE INC./1260 Garnet Drive/Northlake, IL 60164/630-343-1728/Steve Plecki/splecki@labsource.com

10. NORFLEET DISTRIBUTORS/32493 Jefferson Drive/Solon, Oh 44139/216-832-2038/Garrett Norfleet/garrick.norfleet@norfleetdistributors.com-*no bid package*

6. AMD MEDICOM INC./2555 Chemin de L'Aviation/Pointe-Claire, QC, H9P 2Z2/1800-308-6589/Meghan Pels/mpels@amdritmed.com
7. ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY CORP./464 Bass Creek N.W./Huntsville, AL 35801/256-270-8278/Deborah Holt/officemanager@alwayswholesale.com
8. MINI WING USA/2516 Via Tejon , STE 216/Palos Verdes Estates, CA 90274/424-558-3867/Matt Huang/matt@miniwinghealth.com
9. THE SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY/1501 Third Avenue S/Birmingham, AL 35233/205-368-1208/Andy Varner/Andy.Varner@Sherwin.com

1. HEMERA HOLDING LLC/631 Progress Way/Samford, FL 32771/407-732-4306/Angella Difelippo/angella@hemeraholding.com

Non-Collusion Affidavit
EEOC Form
Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify)
Statement of Compliance
Signature Page
On-line Bidding
Samples
Sample Approval

REQUIRED FORMS

Contact Information

Bid Packet
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